MSTC’s e-Procurement Portal Guidelines for Bidders

(The following section is meant only to provide guidance to bidders about the e-procurement
portal of MSTC. These guidelines are subject to change from time to time depending on the
development of the portal. Bidders are advised to keep checking the latest guidelines from
the website to keep themselves updated. They may also contact the offices of MSTC to seek
clarification on any point. MSTC shall not be responsible for any mistake committed by any
bidder or for any consequent loss to the bidder due to misunderstanding anything written
hereunder.)

System Requirement

The following requirements need to be fulfilled for optimum use of MSTC e-procurement
system.

(1) A computer connected to internet through an ISP.

(2) The computer should have adequate RAM depending on version of Windows.

(3) The computer (Desktop / Laptop) should have Windows 7 or above.
The website is best viewed in Internet Explorer version 7 or above. In case there is a different
version being used, the website should be added to Compatibility View Settings as shown
below
Tools > Compatibility View Settings>

& sboutbiank D~ C—| (& New Page 1 & Biank Page

File Edit  View Fg\::}rile@}jelp
Dielete browsing history_ ‘Ctrl-+ Shift+ Del

InPrivate Browsing Ctrl+ Shift+ P
Turn on Tracking Protection

ActiveX Filtering

View downloads Crl+)
Pop-up Blocker >
SmanScreen Fiter >

Manage add-ons

Compatibility View settings

Windows Updste
Performance dashboard Ctrl+Shift+U

F12 Developer Tools

OneMote Linked Notes
send by Blustooth to
Send to OneMote

Blog This in Windows Live Writer

Repor website problems

Internet options
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#elcome to MSTC E-Commerce Page v Safety ~ Tools v

Ala @ESE

About Us | Contact Us

Your security settings put your compute
Select a zone to view or change security sel

& ‘Q v 4/'

Internet Localintranet  Trusted sites  Re

Trusted sites
" / This zone contains websites that you
S trust not to damage your computer or
vour files,

Remove

ation ©

are new to this site, please

st of MSTC SA Principals

Security level for this zone
[C1Require server verification {https:) For all sites in this zone

Custom
- Your security settings are below theg
level, putting your computer at an in
online attack.

- To change the settings, click Custom level.
- To use the recommended settings, click Default level.

g Vendors who desire to participate
ming Events in the forthcoming e-Procurement

= Events may immediately obtain
[ Stetemfevel s ] [ Defautisvel ] t applicable for 5 digital certi%(cate from ar;/y of the
n/e-auction/e-sale/e-booking certifying authorities.
[ Reset all zones to default level ] - 2
anders Wood on a/c © Click For More Details

of Andhra Pradesh iy . .
© Digital Signature Assistance

& Support ©
© High End IBM P-Series Server

BHIDCO

[ OK ] [ Cancel ] Apply
I
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(5) All the ActiveX controls of the Internet Explorer should be Enabled as shown below.
Tools > Internet Options

:;}@"Nhn, JoRd OH@mp@l ‘@Blamcpage X | |

File Edt View Fave Help

Delete browsing history. Ctri+ Shift+Del

InPrivate Browsing Crrl+ Shift+ P
Turn on Tracking Pr
ActiveX Fitering

Fix connection probles
Reopen last browsing fession
Add site to Start men
View downloads Curl+)
Pop-up Blocker
SmartScreen Fitter

Manage add-ons
Compatibility View
Subscribe to this
Feed discovery

Windows Update
Performance dasfboard Crl+Shift+U

F12 Developer Tdals

Internet options

Security > Custom level >

Intemet Optipns
& New Page 1 & Blank Page

—

bt | Connections | Programs | Advanced

| Gendfal Woecurity | prifs

Select a zone to view or change sefurity settings.

@ & |V O

Internet  Localintranet Trpsted sites  Restricted
sites

Internet

0 This zone is for Internet wibsites,
except those listed in trusfed and
restricted zones.

Sites

Security level for this zone

Custom
Custom settings.
-Ta change the setthas, dick Custom level,

-Ta use the recomménded settings, dick Default level.

\

rotected Mod S g nternet Explorer)
k Custom leve i !gefault level

[ Reset all zones to default level ]

\ o ) [Coms ) Cmr )

Uncheck “Enable protected Mode”
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Enable ALL Active—X Controls and Plug-ins

#elcome ko MSTC E-Commerce | l

i [ @= v Page~ Safety~ Tools~

aur current security settings put your computer 3N k. Cli o change ecurity settings. ..

- Security At Risk

ernet thioﬁs [z

General | Security | rivacy | Content | Connections || Programs | A Settings

'3( Your security settings put your computer at risk O Prompt A
Select a zone to view or change security settings. |9, ActiveX controls and plug-ins
~ |#, Allow previously unused ActiveX controls to run without prom
@ g J ® (O Disable =
- 2 ) - ® Enable
Internet Local intranet  Trusted sites  Restricted ¥ Allow Scriptiets
sites = %
(O Disable
Internet = @ Enable
,@ This 2one is for Internet websites, el O Prompt
= except those listed in trusted and ¥ Automatic prompting for ActiveX controls
restricted zones. & %
(O Disable
bt ® Enable
Secutly-level for:this:zorie |#, Binary and script behaviors
(O administrator approved
Custom ) Disable e
- Your security settings are below the recommended /&) Frshla —
level, putting your computer at an increased risk of e ) ‘ R4
online attack. . : *Takes effect after you restart Internet Explorer
- To change the settings, click Custom level.
- To use the recommended settings, click Default level. Reset custom settings
Resetto: | Medium v [ Reset... ]
[ Custom level... ] [ Default level ] High
Medium-high (default
[ Reset all zones to default level ] - Cancel

BHIDCO

& Support ©
© High End IBM P-Series Server

[ OK ][ Cancel ] Apply

(6) Disable “Use Pop-up blocker” under the heading Miscellaneous

#elcome to MSTC E-Commerce | Xy v E) [ @ v Pagev Safety~ Tools~

ernet Options - Security At Risk

Internet Zone

General | Security | privacy | Content | Connections | Programs | Advanced |

Settings
Your security settings put your computer at risk O Disable B
Select a zone to view or change security settings. @ Enable =
e v/ || Submit non-encrypted form data
[ oy
% < v O Disable
Internet  Localintranet Trusted sites  Restricted
sites
Internet
0 This zone is for Internet websites,
\ except those listed in trusted and
restricted zones. || Use SmartScreen Filter
O Disable a
Security level for this zone ® Enable =
Ll Userdata persistence
st O Disable
ussom : : @® Enable
- Your Securlty Settlngs e be[DW the recommended \WWahcitac in lace rvivilanad wah Frankank 2ana can navinaka in o)
level, putting your computer at an increased risk of 3 < T =
online attack. =
- To change the settings, click Custom level. *Takes effect after you restart Internet Explorer
- To use the recommended settings, click Default level.
Reset custom settings et
ni
Reset to: liurn-hi Reset... i
[ Custom level... ] [ Default level ] H IMedlum high (default) be ’ [ 5 ] :1'2
[ Reset all zones to default level ]
HIDCO
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(7) The settings under Browsing History (Under Tools = Internet Options = _General) for
Check for newer versions of web pages should be kept at Every ti visit the webpage
as shown below.

Welcome to MSTC E-Commerce

aur current security settings put your comj

Home page -
m To create home page tabs, type each address on its own line, dlorer stares copies of webpages, images, and media
e, about:blank E
fr newer versions of stored pages: r’
@ Every time I visit the webpage

[ e ithiarE J [ Use default ] [ Use blark ] OEvery time I start Internet Explorer y
O automatically .
Browsing history 1
O Never
71, Delete temporary files, history, cookies, saved passwords,
¥ and web form information, Disk space to use (8-1024ME) | 312 B
; (Recommended: S0-250MEB)
Delete browsing history on exit
Current location:

[ Delete... ] [ Settings ] C:\Documents and SettingsiAdministratoriLocal e

Search - SettingsiTemporary Internet Files

p Change search defaults. Settings I

[ Move folder... ] [ View objects ] [ View files ]

Tabs
: e
Change how webpages are displayed in Settings History L
[~ tabs. Specify how many days Internet Explorer should save the list i
of websites you have visited, (i
frpesance Days to keep pages in history: ’ 20 ;
[ Colors ] [ Languages J [ Fonts ] [ Accessibility ] | El

] OK ][ Cancel J s

Lok J[ concel | Apply © High End IBM P-Seri

(8) Latest Drivers for your Digital Signature Certificate should be installed properly in the
computer.
(9) The computer should have latest Java Runtime Environment version (Windows X86

Offline file) installed in it.

(10) For Browser related settings, please refer to the ‘View Video’ available above ‘Vendor
Login’

(11) The PC should run as an Administrator to install packages on being prompted on
screen like TCS signer file for signing with DSC, Java encryption applet for data
encryption, etc.
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~ The protected mode of the computer should be turned off as described below.
Internet Options EERy—————)

Select & 2ome to view or Change security settngs.

e E v S

Internet Locad mtramnet Trusted sites Restncted

Trusted sstes [
J Ties zomne contains websites that yoo

tTust not to damage your computer o

yousr fes,

You have websites o thes zome.

Searity level for thes zone

Custorn
Custorm settngs.
- To change the settings, dcdk Custom level.
- To use the recommended settngs, cick Default level.

[V Enabie Protected Mode (reguires restartng Intermeat Explorer)
( Crsstom lewed. . . ] [ Defsuit level ]

( Reset al romnes to default ewvel J

me—
Under Tools> Internet Options > Security > There is a check box “ENABLE PROTECTED MODE”.

To enable the Digital Signature Certificate appear in the Signer the box should be unchecked as
shown below.

Vlnternet Options / l—m' -

| General | Secunity | Privacy | Content | Connections |

L Sites J

tom settngs.
- To change thhe ssttngs, cdick Custom levell
-~ To use the recommended settings, cick Default level.

|| Enable Protected Mode (Feguires restarting Intermet Explores)
[ Custom level... ] [ Default level ]

[ Reset &l rones to default level ]

e [l e | e e
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After Changing the settings the message might appear on your screen “Your current security
settings put your computer at risk. Click here to change your security settings” as shown in
subsequent screenshots. This should not be fixed under any circumstances. Initially it might
appear with a blue question mark as shown below.

Fie EdtdfView FavorRes Tools Help

@ :

~ £ _ FreeHotmal 2 + £ Inbox

11w, mstcecommerce.com/

Y == v Page - Safety - Tooks > ¥~

Y our current security settings put your computer at risk. Click here to change your security settings.

={
© Internet A~ iRios®n -
In the above case, the blue question mark sign indicates that the website wants to run certain
add-on/s. That should be done by right clicking on the icon and running the add-ons as shown
in subsequent screenshots.

Right Click on the message and run the add-on/s as they appear.

[# Done

al 2 * £ Inbox

»

o | "p v E) - U mm - Page~ Sefety~ Tock~ K~
) Your current security setione nub uour comodtar sb Il hara bn thanne v w .-.....».vil!m_ o x

Add-on Disabled Run Add-on ;J
Security Settings at Risk »  Run Add-on on All Websites

‘What's the Risk?

Information Bar Help it ek
—— T
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A sample add-on is shown below when the add-on wants to run. Click on Run to allow that add-

on.

T s Y == T~

Fis Edt View Favoeitas Tools (Help /

L7 Favorkes | 1% 57 GoogleNews £ Suggested Shes 2 FreeHotmal 2 Web Sice Galers = & Inbox

ﬁl-l &8 hittp: [ {wwews msteecomme... X I 48 Coal Mine Allocation I I oy - g - Page~ Safety~ Tooks- -

‘9Vwcw«tsemtyse&k\qswmcmansk(ickhvetodumywse:utysotm... x
| =

Internet Explorer - Security Warning

Do you want to run this ActiveX control?

Name: Microsoft® License Manager DLL
Publisher: Microsoft Corporation

ly added to your when you installed
another program, or when Windows was instalied. You should only run & I you
trust the publisher and the webske requesting it, What's the risk?

Another add-on, the signer form, also needs to run similarly to allow DSC’s to sign digitally.

Internet Options ?

‘ Seaurity | privacy | content | Connectons | Programs | Advanced |

j| & MSTC E-Commerce X

Security Settings - Trusted Sites Zone

Select a zone to view or change security settings.

q
Set
“ % J G I etnes bout Us | Contact Ust
Internet  Localintranet Trustedsites  Restricted 9% Enable NET Framemork setup @ -
sites () Disable

(@ Enable

s S [RRIRE
) liscelaneous
This zane contains websites that you tes 5 U

et ot to et your commtor o | || Access data sources acrass domains
vour files, O Disable
Yfou have websites in this zone (@ Enable

Security level for this zone O Prompt
] Allow dragging of Dgtent between domains into separate wi

(@ Disable

Custom O Enable
e etings, cick Custom evel [ Alow dragging of content begen domains into the same wi

-To use the recommended settings, click Defait level. Disable

() Enable

M Allow META REFRESH
) rirzhla

["]Enable Protected Mode {requires restarting Internet Explarer) =

Custom level... Default level
Reset all zones to default level

Takes effect after you restart your computer

Reset custom settings

Resettol  Medium (default) v

MDO

WMDC. THEB.

cer

Certification [ 1 [ERENETS

Home | Terms of Use | Notice | Privacy Policy | Vendor Guide| Java Download] FAQ

Under Tools>Internet Options> Security> Miscellaneous select enable for “Access data Sources
across domains”
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A. Registration

Visit the website https://www.mstcecommerce.com/eprochome/ and select logo of the buyer.

@O 4 ]g http://www.mstcecommerce.com/eprochome/ - | ‘7] x | ',O Bing P "

i Favorites | 5l &) ecommerce.com @] auction.com g | E-PROC DEMO ADMIN L... | E-PROC ADMIN LOGIN | Admin Login DEMO g Admin Login

\eMSTC E-Commerce ‘ ‘ o~ ~ [ g=h v Pagev Safety~ Tools~ @~

& About Us | Contact Us &

HOCL, Kochi

s,

—

These

Developer

© View Video @ cum

Operator

Certification

Home | Terms of Use | Notice | Privacy Policy | Vendor Guide| Java Download| FAQ

1216PM | |

w L
2O 017

On selecting the Buyer’s logo, the Vendor Login page gets displayed

- a
Q@|@ https://ww mstcecommerce.com/cprochome/tb O ~ @ & || € Welcome to RBI e-Procure... Aok

File Edit View Favorites Tools Help

A
| Home | AboutUs | TermsofUse | Notices | Privacy Policy | Corporate site | Contact Us | View Video
| RBI Login
| .
| Bulletin Board
| Username Username
Password Live Tenders Password
Forthcoming Tenders
Login Reset Login Reset
Reset Password? Reset Password?
| Reset Password without Register as Vendor
Welcome to RBI e- MSTC SUPPORT
Procurement...
| Veiidor Giiide © 30 MBPS LEASE LINE
© High End IBM P-Series Server
4 Java Download © skilled Support Team
@ o © 24x7 Hrs. Support
© Disaster Recovery Site
[ Download NIT/Corr. © Best Viewed in IE 7 & Above
|
| vl

copyright@MSTC Limited 2014 |
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On the Login Page, there is a “Video Guide” for system related configuration and a “Vendor Guide” for

step by step guidance about the procedure.

- o EEM

ww.mstcecommerce.com/eprochome/rb O ~ @ & ][ @& Welcome to RBI e-Procure... T % £23
File Edit View Favorites Tools Help
SR v ~ ~
_ LN F T
mwdd MSTC 28 = £; £5,
Lo WP v N\ g3 FIPEREZ
T S EEHEA
e Y Es
IBM e N 55 fi >
= () N E EE FF A7
Home | AboutUs | Terms of Use | Notices | Privacy Policy | Corporate sjj Contact Us | View Video
Vendor Login
Bulletin Board
Username Username
Password Troa T eailers Password
Forthcomy
Login Reset Login Reset
Reset Password? Reset Password?
Reset Password without Register as Vendor
Welcome to RBI e- MSTC SUPPORT
Procurement...
B Vendor Guide © 30 MBPS LEASE LINE
© High End IBM P-Series Server
.+ dava Download © skilled Support Team
@ o © 24x7 Hrs. Support
© Disaster Recovery Site
[f Download NIT/Corr. © Best Viewed in IE 7 & Above
v

copyright @MSTC Limited 2014

Click on “Register As Vendor”.

A Form will open up. Fill up the Form and click on Submit.

Iz Register Yendor, - Windows Internet Explorer

@\k}v || hetpud o mstcacommerce.comfepros liadminjregister_vendor.jsp o [#2] ] | |[o]-
i Fle Edt View Favortes Took Help i Links 2

= ] = ]
W & I@Reguster Vendor I } § fpreme - B dhPrint - [k Page + i) Tools ~

50 Vour current security settings put your camputer at risk, Click here ko change your security settings...

| Home |
MSTC B rrocwomens MSTC Limited

e-Procurement >*Yendor > New Registration

Personal Information

Company Name*

Company Type® [ —Select Company type-—— ||

Choose a Username * l:lchck here to check availability of your User |d
Choose a Password * l:lw“f‘nur Password is Case Sensitive |
Retype Password * l:l

Your Contact Details
T

Wobile Phone No l:llp\ease provide mohile no. to serve you better)

T —

Fax No

Your Contact Address

[£3

@ &4 Local intranet H100% -
& [ & Manusls o

You need to create your own user name and password. Please check availability of user id and password
policy before creating the same. Please do not use any special character in any field except one for
password. The only special character allowed for password is “@”
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E Register Vendor - Windows Internet Explorer

@ L A \g, bkt msteecammerce. com/eprachame moili admin/register_vendar. jsp

v|$, X‘

: File Edit View Favorites Tooks  Help

fiHome ~ [

ilinks *

= »
o Print + |+ Page v () Tools ~

ﬁil (& Register Vendor I_l

(<]

Your current security settings put your computer at risk, Click here bo change wour security settings... X
Pin*:
Country*: ‘ [ other l:l
State* : ‘ ‘ Select State W

More about Yourseif
In Favor Of *: l:lulauyertu make payment in favour of e.g. your Cempany Name or Person)

meant[ ] {applicable Only Forlndia.)
Sales Tax No: l:l
Bankers Name * : |:|
Bank Account No™ l:l
Branch Code: l:l
Type Of Account - || Select Account Type ¥
Fccos( ]

Se\ectBuyer;WO‘L LIMITED v

e I:|

Refishimagel| | Gl
| accept the Terms 'n' Conditions. Click here to see Terms 'n' Conditions: —

Submit

Supply For Whom*:

v

LTI

@ & Localintranet
I stant :

£ e (& Manuals

Please refresh the image before clicking on Submit button. After that a preview page will appear and if
you press continue then a message of successful registration will come

This completes the on-line registration process. Your account is auto-activated (unless mentioned
otherwise) and you may proceed to login.
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_omm
g@|@ hitps://www mstcecommerce.com/eprochome/tb O ~ @ © || & Welcome to RBI e-Procure... | | A ok

File Edit View Favorites Tools Help

mwdd Maw MSTC
ey

LiMITED

Home | AboutUs | TermsofUse | Notices | Privacy Policy | Corporate site | Contact Us | View Video

Vendor Login

Bulletin Board

Username Username

Password Password

Live Tenders

Forthcoming Tenders

Login Reset Login Reset

Reset Password? Reset Password?

Reset Password without Register as Vendor

MSTC SUPPORT

© 30 MBPS LEASE LINE

© High End IBM P-Series Server
© Skilled Support Team

© 24x7 Hrs. Support

© Disaster Recovery Site

© Best Viewed in IE 7 & Above

B vendor Guide

Java Download

copyright@MSTC Limited 2014

Type your user id and password and click on Login. The system shall ask for your DSC as below.

= om
5
i

el’\:)‘.\‘@ https:/ /www.mstcecommerce.com/eprocheme/ko O ~ @ & H & Welcome to KePT e-Procur... % | ‘
File Edit View Favorites Tools Help

wwdd sow MSTC
Lah ST

Home | AboutUs | TermsofUse | Notices | Privacy Policy | Corporate site | Contact Us | View Video

KoPT Login Vendor Login
Bulletin Board
Username Username
Message from webpage &3
Li
Password 4 Password
o You Have To Verify Your DSC To Login.
2, = =
Login Reset Login Reset
2] Do you want proceed now ..
Reset Password? o) Reset Password?

Reset Password without |8 e e

STC SUPPORT

Procurement...
© 30 MBPS LEASE LINE

© High End IBM P-Series Server
& lava Download © Skilled Support Team
Q =0 © 247 Hrs. Support

© Disaster Recovery Site
[X Download NIT/Corr. © Best Viewed in IE 7 & Above

of HDC EMD/Tender Fee
Payment

B vendor Guide

copyright@MSTC Limited 2014
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& hitp:/ fwww.mstcecommerce.com/eprochome/DigitalSigner/RegisterDigital Cert jsp - Windows Internet Explorer = [ = [&=]

@\J - ‘Q http://www.mstcecommerce.com/eprochome/DigitalSigner/RegisterDigitalCert.jsp - | “?‘ X | |)' Bing Pl

57 Favorites | 53 2| ecommerce.com | auction.com | E-PROC DEMO ADMIN L. g E-PROC ADMIN LOGIN g Admin Login_DEMO g | Admin Login

- P
¥ http:/fwww.mstcecommerce.com/eprochome/D.. }',I\ ~ B - [ M ~ Page~ Safety~ Tools~ (@~
Select a Certificate [

qv

TATA CONSULTANCY SERVICES
TATA
N
R Select the Certificate you want to use.
= Click View Certificate for Certificate Details.
Issued To | Issued By ‘ Serial No. Expiration Date | Issuer Deta =
[=EIMSTCDS14 MSTCDS14 2713E8D6 09-08-2024 :... CN=MSTCD|
Sumana Ma... Sumana Maity 6OA3ABGE 14-09-2020 :... CN=Suman

ElmsTcDse MSTCDSE B605793BE 09-09-2024 ;... CN=MSTCD
ElmsTCcDSs2 MSTCDS2 687C755%4 09-09-2024 :... CN=MSTCD
[ElPFC_UTIL_S2 PFC_UTIL S2  78CC57DB 31-12-2020 t... CN=PFC_UT -
= e T e T Rrrr———
< m | r

K | Cancel View Certificate

Ohrvard

Copyright & 2006 Tata Consultancy Services Lid,

@ |1z | e

Bl e o]0l ] 7?

Click on OK and select your DSC in the signer form for authentication. When you are logging into the
system for the first time, system shall verify the name of the person to whom the DSC has been issued
and the name of the contact person provided during registration, for the user id being used for logging
in. If the two names match, system will map the user id with the DSC without any prompt. If the two
names don’t match, system will give an alert stating that the two names are different and will ask you to
confirm that the DSC being used is the correct DSC for the user id and ask for synchronization. If you
proceed with the DSC, system will automatically synchronize the contact person’s name to match with
name of the person holding the DSC and will map the DSC with the user id for future use. For all
subsequent logins, system will check if the correct pair of user id and DSC are being used or not and will
allow login only if the correct pair of DSC and user id are used. Else, system will prevent you from logging
into the system.

NOTE:- For the DSC to appear in the signer form, the token must be plugged in, proper DSC driver
installed and the “ENABLE PROTECTED MODE” disabled as shown in the settings.
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Change / Forget Password

a. Incase a Bidder who has already registered its DSC forgets its password or wishes to change its
password, it shall click on the link Reset password.

- oW
ok

e@] © https://wwmstcecommerce.com/eprochome/tb O ~ @ & || @ Welcome to RBI e-Procure...

File Edit View Favorites Tools Help

wwdd M MSTC

LIMITED

Bulletin Board

Username Username

Forthcoming Tenders

Password Password

Login Reset Login Reset
Reset Password? Reset Password?
Reset Password without Register as Vendor
Welcome to RBI e- MSTC SUPPORT
Procurement...
B Vendor Guide © 30 MBPS LEASE LINE
© High End IBM P-Series Server
4 Java Download © skilled Support Team
@ o © 24x7 Hrs. Support
© Disaster Recovery Site
[ Download NIT/Corr. © Best Viewed in IE 7 & Above

copyright@MSTC Limited 2014

7~ RESET PASSWORD - Windows Internet Explorer [
&5 - (B 10,1 5. 85 /amcchomermaliracat_swd_vandar s 8] (2[5 [cive searet 1=
Fle Edk View Faverber Tack el L

i Home - B fecd (- dwh Pt - [k Paos - 3 Tools ~

= v ke ak risk, Click hare to

RESET PASSWORD

Entar USER 1D ¢ | ]

Enter New PASSWORD :

Retype PASSWORD Again:

[
L
[reset |

9 Micrasoft Excel - ke, . = Manuals

Fill up the fields and click on reset. The system will ask for DSC and if authenticated correctly, the
password will be reset. Please remember that this facility is available only after first successful login with
the DSC.
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In case a Bidder who forgot its password before registering DSC, it shall select Forgot Password

link available in www.mstcecommerce.com/eprochome

~[ 4] x [P ing

s Favorkes | <3 ] ecommerce.com | auction.com g E-PROCDEMO ADMINL... ] E-PROC ADMINLOGIN ] Admin Login DEMO ] Admin Login
xl [ T v [ @ v Pagev Safetyv Tookv @~ =

|

88 ‘ -| e\msacﬁon Payment Peri.. ‘ (€ http://101.6.165/eprocho... j & MSTC E-Commerce

4 About Us | Contact Us&

HOCL, Kochi

2,
%

Y

&

wreny
LD

Y b %
OPGC % | T 188>
ANDREW YULE

OPGC Ltd

Operator
MDC
Hooghly printid — yocer

NMD
NMDC Limited
23 Next>

Dalims | Mandar Ruidal 1aua Nawnlazdl EAN

Q. Local intranet | Protected Mode: Off

() 10:55 AM
3/4/2017

Hama | Tarme af lica | Natica | D
http://www.mstcecommerce.com/eprochome/nmdc/buyer_login.jsp
— =

(xz) | M) || P

Blel> ols
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B. DOWNLOADING OF NIT / CORRIGENDUM BY BIDDER

Unregistered Bidders
Step 1: Click “Download NIT/Corr”

€ Welcome to TANGEDCO e-Procurbment - Windows Intemet Explorer

B el =]

ochome/tneb/buyer_login.jsp

-
@U @ |g http://10.1.6.85/ep

5% & E-PROC DEMO ADMIN L...

iy Favorites

|88 I~ & Transaction Payment Peri.{ | & http://101.6165/eprocho... | (& Welcome to TANGEDC... X 1 ‘

~[és [ x ][ 8ing

& E-PROC ADMIN LOGIN & | Admin Login DEMO & | Admin Login & | MSTC PNA SIGN-IN £3 Contact Details

% v B v [ @ v Pagev Safety~ Tooks~ @~

p ~|

»

»

Privacy Policy |

Notices |

Corporate site |

ContactUs | View Video

Bulletin Board

Username

Password Live Tenders

Forthcoming Tenders

Login

Reset Password?

Reset Password 'vithout DSC

Welcome to

Vendor Guide

R Q

Download NIT/Corr.

Vendor Login

Username

Password

Login

Reset Password?

Register as Vendor

MSTC SUPPORT

© 30 MBPS LEASE LINE

© High End IBM P-Series Server
© skilled Support Team

© 24x7 Hrs. Support

© Disaster Recovery Site

© Best Viewed in IE 7 & Above

mn

/ Trusted sites | Protected Mode: Off fa v ®100%

eIl

-

Step 2: 1Click ‘Proceed’ button and fill up the format providing the details of Company Name, e-mail ID,

Mobile No. & Name of the contact person and click on “Submit”.

Windows Internet Explorer

/= DEMO Admin Login -

on_req_buyer.jsp

OO - [ i

Edit

File View Favorites  Tools  Help

W < [ @ pEMo admin Lagin

=

If You are a Registered Vendor Please Login and Download. LOGIN

Otherwise Please Proceed and Enter Details to Download ... [PROCEED

COMPANY NAME : |

\

EMAIL ADDRESS : | |
MOBILE : [ |
|

CONTACT PERSON : I
SUBMIT

100w v

R
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Step 3: After submission of the details, select the event No., select the notice/corrigendum and
download the same.

¢= Download Tender Notice - Windows Internet Explorer

& & - [] rtistumm msteocommerze. comieproceaalindisfciinen_reg_buyer.ise

File Edit View Favorites Tools  Help

e I & Dowinload Tender Notice ]71

& [$2] [%] [Live Search |[2]-

p - B - dmh - [rPage - £FTooks -

wnload Tender Notice
SELECT EVENT NO

Select Event Mo [Event 1D]
MSTC/CILI2- 3

MSTC/CILI12-13/20[120019]
MSTCICILM2-13/21(120020]
MSTC/CILM2-13/22(120021]

Done

[ @ Internet w100~

b. Registered Bidders
Step 1: In “Vendor Login” link, Login with user ID, password & DSC.

—
) C) € v nrnmatcecommercecomisprochomdmng - @ & || @ Wekometo 81 eprocue.. x |11 & e 3

File Edit View Favorites Tools Help

WYY
e
a £

Terms of Use |

& Som
wj\'am ; !LJSTC

Home | AboutUs |

RBI Login

Notices | Privacy Policy |

Vendor Login
Bulletin Board

Username Username

Live Tenders
Eaaavud Forthcoming Tenders kasaiord

Login Reset

Reset Password?

Reset Password without Register as Vendor

Welcome to RBI e-

MSTC SUPPORT

Procurement...
Vendor Guide © 30 MBPS LEASE LINE
© High End 1BM P-Series Server
& Java Download © skilled Support Team
@ o © 24x7 Hrs. Support
© Disaster Recovery Site
¥ Download NIT/Corr.

© Best Viewed in IE 7 & Above

copyright@MSTC Limited 2014
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e
& Welcome Vendor... - Windows Internet Explorer
&~ &) e
i Favorites | 5% ] ecommerce.com & auction.com | E-PROC DEMO ADMIN L... 2] E-PROC ADMIN LOGIN | Admin Login_DEMO 2] Admin Login

| @ Welcome Vendor... [ | & - ~ 7] den ~ Page~ Safety~ Tools~v @hw

www.mstcecommerce.com/ eprochome/kopt/admin/VendorPanel/vendor_home.jsp - | 3 ‘ = | |_53 Bing

Welcome M

=- [ vendor Home..
=[] KoPTVENDORL ..
=[] My Menu
Download MIT/Corrigendum

Pre-Bid Meeting Report4
PRE BID MEET VENDOR
AUC FLOOR MANGR
WVIEW PROFILE
Technical CST
Price CST
Transaction Fee Entry
Delete NoDocs
Transaction Fee Paymerjt

= B2 =R AR A EER
Step 2: Click “Download Nit/Corrigendum” link.

| —
& ko Ve, - Vo et o [ 5| Ter——— =
GO' [B) 1585 +[4]x[[P o LA G@v e — <[é] % [P g
S Foits | G5 & EFROCDIMOADMML.. | E-ROCADMNL0GN g Adinloge D) ¢ Adrinlog g MSTCPASGLM £ oDt ' Gy Fowits | 75 g EROCOMOADMNL. & EOCADMNLOGN 2 AdinLogh DEMO & AdinLagin £ MSTCPNA SN ) Conct et
P B0 s | | e §r0eC 8 e e e e

Download NIT/Corregendum
SELECTEVENTNO:  SseErerlio Eoell
el Bl SELECT EVENT TANGEDCO/CE-Chennai Matzndl Wanagement 116-1TETZR300] =
ek o, NO:
SELECT |
A NIT/CORR.Other G2k Fie
Docs:
Maite 16-17-E1-22380Hnice 1612 Tender Documeripd . 3012017
4
/
Tone:  Tnsied st | Potced Mede OF G R - Tone:  Trsiedsies| Puéeced Mode Off Gv R -
= = =
7 ol @
ﬁ ela0 8k

Step 3: Select the event and select the NIT/CORRIGENDUM and download & save.
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C. Online Pre-Bid Meet

Log in with your user id, password and DSC. Click on the link PRE BID MEET VENDOR, select the event,
type in your query in the box provided and click on Send.

¢= Welcome Vendor... - Windows Internet Explorer

5?_;: ~ |[&] neepiir10.1.6.165/epracicoalindiajcivendorPanelivendor_home. isp N = [#2] [ <] [Live search |2~
e B @ uetcome veror.. 1 N\ B - B - & - [ recs - G ook -

Welcome MAJUMDAR BHASKAR BM

Pre Bid Online Meeting
- [C] PRE BID MEET W

PRE BID MEET RI Select Event | MSTC/CIL/12-13/50 |~

AUC FLOOR MAN
MNIT/CORRIGEMDI
TOE Status Type Your Query here and click send button \

EMD Payment hat is th + az
atis the payment perio Send

wendaor e-Payme

Welcome MAJUMDAR BHA'

=0 vendor Home..
=0 eHASKAR..
-0 My Menu

Lol g =t 1l BN 2012/6/4 12:12:47

Response from Buyer will be displayed belows

A
|%

[} &8 mnternet 100w v
& WL 1219 FM

Done

¥2 start

/2 Walcumee Yemdor WinGews Mtormnet Lapheivr
° - .. L L N e R e e ettt L N - - »~
G B | e Vb - w R e e
i o MANUSADAS Do AN - Woake s MAA M ANAAN Fava'an P »
s i Onsbiew:
TR N YERT V
POE RO MEET W Salect Event uu LIt 1300
AL FLOOR MAAF
Y »
} RV ORISR T See amey e e e p— = —
F W PR RS | 3ema )
J ventss o Povwre Dy ——

Fangaman Vierm Suver wit b Sasryed bewvs

- A L e -

When the Buyer replies to your query, it will be automatically displayed under your query in the second
display box as shown above. You can view all the queries and the replies theretoxquring the Pre Bid
Meeting without knowing the names of the persons raising the queries.

The Pre Bid Reports of all concluded Pre Bid Meetings can be accessed through the link PRE BID MEET
REPORT.

Page 19 of 32



D.Transaction Fee Payment

Log in as “Vendor” with your user id, password and DSC. The vendor shall have the facility of making
the payment either through NEFT or Online Payment.
Click on Transaction Fee Payment

] - |
[ |6 FTr—— Y] [-Jr— <1 o

File Edit View Favorites Tools Help

56 Welcome MSTCDS6

=[] vendor Home..
&= [ kopTVENDOR:
= [ my Menu
I=] Download NIT/Corrigandum
Pre-Bid Meeting Report
PRE BID MEET VENDOR
AUC FLOOR MANGR
VIEW PROFILE
Technical CST
Price CST
Delete NoDocs
Transaction Fee Payment

Welcome MS

1210 PM

3/2272007

Select event no from the drop down box

- rendor... -

& = [#&] nitpiswwnvmstcecommerce.com/eprochome/ kopt/admin/VendorPanel/vendor_home=p ~[ % | > | [5> 8ing o —|
<l Favorites | 5is 2] ecommerce.com 2| auction.com | E-PROC DEMO ADMIN L... 42| E-PROC ADMIN LOGIN | Admin Login_DERMO 2| Admin Login -
| @8 welcome vendaor. | | i - E) — =1 www — Page~ Safety~ Tools— &dw

Select a Event : Select a Event
Selocl o Even
KoPT/olkata Dock Systam/CE/236/16-17/E /540
KoFT/Haldia Dock ComplexFin Divi1/16-17/ET/SS0
KoPT/Haldia Dock ComplewFin DIv216-17/ET/S88
KoPT/Haldla Dock ComplexiAdmn. DIvi16/16-17/ETISTS
KoPT/Haldla Dock ComplexMO DIvi18/16-17/ETISTE
KoPT/Haldia Dock ComplexI&CF DIWT216-17/ET/497
KoPTA<olkata
KoPTA<olkata
KoPTA<olkata
KoPTHalk,
KoPTA<olkata
KoPT/olkata Dock Systen/CE/233/16-17/ET/535
KoPT/olkata Dock Systen?CE/234/16-17/ET/536
KoPT/Haldia Dock ComplexwP&E Diws/16-17/ET/548
KoPT/i<olkata Dock System/CE/241/16-17/E T/550
KoPT/Haldia Dock ComplexMM DiwaG/16-17/ETISE]
Dock System/CE/255/16-17/ET/582

Dock Systerm/MM/IZ5/16-17/ETid54

Dock Systerm/MIMIZ8/16-17/ETI546

Dock Systerm/PnR/10/16-17/ET/529

Dock Systerm/CE/244/16-17/ETI5S54

Dock Systerm/CE/245/16-17/ETISSS
Dock ComplexMM Diva7/16-17T/ETISS8
KoPTA<olkata Dock Systerm/CE/257/16-17/ET/S90
KoPTh<olkata Dock Systerm/CE/258/16-17/ET/S91
KoPTh<olkata Dock SystermiMEDI23/16-17/ETIS22
KoPTh<olkata Dock System/CE/250/16-17/ET/S92
KoPT/Haldia Dock ComplexI&CF D7 6161 7/ETIS2E
KoFT/Haldia Dock © F DIW7B/16-17/ETIS38  ~

e = S [ =]
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Select NEFT/ RTGS or Online Payment.

c@‘@ hitps:/ /. mstcecommerce.com/cprochome/ke £ - @ & || & Welcome Vendor... x | ‘ {7 F 53
Welcome MSTCDS6 »

Select a Event : [KoPT/Haldia Dock Complex/Rly Div/2/16-17/ET/565 ~]

Transaction fee : 5681.0

Select Payment Type: (® NEFT/RTGS () Online Payment

Proceed To Payment

Note:
1. Payment should be made within 2 days after genarating the Challan for NEFT/RTGS otherwiss the challan shall become invalid.

2. For making payment through Online Payment option, please make sure that your website address has https and you have enabled "access data sources across domains” under Miscellaneous tab. (Tools -+ Internet Options -~

Sacurity --> Custom Lavel -> Miscellansous).

hitps://www.mstcecommerce.com/eprochome/kopt/ad

1217 PM
3/22/2017

[ T EN &

On selecting NEFT, the vendor shall generate a challan by filling up a form. The vendor shall
remit the transaction fee amount as per the details printed on the challan without making
change in the same.

-
[ ¢ |6 T ——————y Y] [ ym— <[ o

Welcome MSTCDS6 4 ‘Welcome MSTCDS6 »

=[] vendor Home..
= [} kopTvENDORI..
= [ My Menu

[_] Download NIT/Corrig
|| Pre-Bid Meeting Rep.
PRE BID MEET VENC

|- Technical csT

|| price csT

L] Delete NoDocs

|| Transaction Fee Pay

RTGS/NEFT Transaction Fees (To be Filled by Applicant For Bank Details)

Date : 22/03/2017

Bank Name :

Address 1 :

Address 3 :

\ |
\ |
Address 2 : ‘ ‘
\ \
\ |

City :

Pin Code :

Account Title : ‘ ‘

Debit Account No : | |

Account Type : Savings

Gurrent
Over Draft
Generate Challan

Amount (in figures.) :

ke =

(=R

1218 PM
3/2272007

s PHBRRS

Take the printout of the challan and make the payment.
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@D [ v/ iommmtcscommerce.comieprochomerko £ - @ € | & wetcome venser.. <] AL

Welcome MSTCDS6 < Welcome MSTCDS6 >

=[] vendor Home.. N
=[] KOPTVENDOR1.. To,
My Menu

| Download HIT/Corric State Bank of India

] Pre-Bid Meeting Rep La Martiniere Branch

[ PRE BID MEET VENC AJC Bose Road
KOLKATA

[] Auc FLOOR ManGR
[7] vIEw PROFILE

L] Technical csT

L] Price csT

[, | Delete NoDocs

700020
Sub :: Request for transfer of fund by RTGS/ NEFT

Applicant Details

L] Transaction Fee Pay Account Title ABC
Debit Account No 9874562310
Account Type(Savings/Current/Over Draft) Savings
Beneficiary Details
Beneficiary Name MSTC LIMITED
Credit Account No ZMECOMO00000028728
Bank Indusind Bank
Branch Kolkata
Account Type Current Account
IFSC Code INDBOO0O0O15

Remittance Details

Amount Rs. 5681.0 /-

Amount (in figures.) Rupees Five Thousand Six Hundred Eighty One Only

Please remit the amount as per the aforesaid details, by debiting myfour account for the amount of remittance with the following remittance details:
Remittance Data :Transaction Fee for E-Tender no:( KoPT/Haldia Dock Complex/Rly Div/2/16-17/ET/565 ) by the bidder
kopttestvendorone

Thanking you,

12:24 PM
17

There shall be auto authorization of payment. Bidder shall be receiving a system generated
mail.

On selecting Online Payment, the vendor shall have the provision of making payment using its
Credit/ Debit Card/ Net Banking. On proceeding for payment, a transaction number is
generated. Click on “Ok” to proceed to the payment gateway page as shown below.

a

e"fy“@ https:/ /v mstcecommerce.com/eprochome/ko O = N H & Welcome Vendor... X | ‘ oy 7 &

File Edit View Favorites Tools Help

Welcome MSTCDS6

Select a Event : KoPT/Haldia Dock Complex/Rly Divi2/16-17/ET/565 v
Transaction fee : 5681.0
Select Payment Type: (D NEFT/RTGS (@ Online Payment
Note:

1. Payment should \ shall become invalid.
Messade from webpage

2. For making payment through Online Payment option, please make ss domains" under Miscellaneaus tab. (Tools --> Internet Options ==

You MSTC Transaction Ne Is : 226 Do You Want To Proceed For
Online Transaction 7

1213 PM

3/2272007
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- o N

O o mscemmacscom oo £+ 8 6| S wacameverer. <[ S e

aAt@M :

payment solutions for every business

Order Summary Verified by

Merchant Name: MSTC LIMITED -WWW.MSTCECOMMERCE.COM/EPROCHOME
Brand Name: MSTC LIMITED

Order placed for Amount INR 5681.00 with transaction 1D 28726 at 22 Mar 2017 MasterCard.
SecureCode

searr more

leam more

Mobile Number * : E-mail * :

Please Select your payment Mode —
Payment Mode [EEFTESIN SafeKey

Certified by

( PCI-DSS
certified by SISA

Total Amount: 5681.00
5B & & Y

On the payment gateway page the bidder has the option to make payment through Net Banking, Credit
Card or Debit Card by selecting the desired option from the drop down menu.

Once the payment gets credited to MSTC'’s designated bank account, the transaction fee shall
be authorized automatically and the vendor shall be receiving a system generated mail.
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E. Bidding in e-tender

Log into the website with your user id, password and DSC.
Click on AUC FLOOR MANGR

-8
< [ G et

g@‘@ https:"vaw.mstcecommlrce‘:om-'eprocl’\omé-'ko L-ac H & Welcome Vendor...

File Edit View Favorites Tools | Help
Welcome MSTCDS6

Welcome MSTCDS6

&[] vendor Home..
&[] KOPTVENDORS..
=

L] Auc FLOOR MaNGR

|| view proFILE

|| Technical csT

| price csT

|| Delete NoDocs

|| Transaction Fee Payment

1210PM

3/2272007

Click on Live Events to view and participate in running events.
Click on Forthcoming to view upcoming events.
-

[« ST | G

/www.mstcecommerce.com/eprachome/ko O = @& € H (& Welcome Vendor... X

=[] vendor Home.. A
KOPTVENDORL1..
HiMSTCDS6
ocurement Event Info . 2017/3/22 1
|| Auc FLOOR MANGR
[l view proFILE Select Buyer -
[ Technical csT Live e-Procurement Events :
|| price csT
| | Delete NoDocs Forthcoming e-Procurement Events :
E: Transaction Fee Payi
e-Procurement Event L g For rocurement Events »
e Procurement Event No. e-Procurement Event Start Date e-Procurement Event Close Date
8 KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/MED/25/16-17/ET/559 2017-02-25 10:00 2017-03-28 15:00
£ KOPT/HALDIA DOCK COMPLEX/RLY DIV/2/16-17/ET/565 2017-02-27 11:00 2017-03-27 15:00
8 KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/PNR/11/16-17/ET/586 2017-03-10 12:30 2017-04-03 14:00
0 KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CME/42/16-17/ET/587 2017-03-15 11:00 2017-03-27 14:00
0 KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/PNR/12/16-17/ET/589 2017-03-10 15:00 2017-03-24 14:00
0 KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CE/260/16-17/ET/593 2017-02-28 15:00 2017-03-28 15:00
0 KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CE/261/16-17/ET/594 2017-03-05 15:00 2017-03-28 15:00
0 KOPT/HALDIA DOCK COMPLEX/MO DIV/A9/I6-1TET/595  2017-03-22 11:15 2017-03-29 16:00
0 KOPT/HALDIA DOCK COMPLEX/ADMN. DIVA7/16.17/ET/507 2017-03-15 09:30 2017-03-28 15:00
2 KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CE/262/16-17/ET/598 2017-03-08 12:00 2017-03-28 15:00
2 KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CE264/16-17/ET/602 2017-03-10 15:00 2017-03-3115:00
© KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CE/265/16-17/ET/603 2017-03-13 12:00 2017-04-06 15:00
2 KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CE/266/16-17/ET/604 2017-03-1212:00 2017-03-31 15:00
O KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CME/M5/16-17/ET/605 2017-03-15 14:00 2017-04-17 14:30
< > 8 KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CER267/16-17/ET/606 2017-03-1712:00 2017-04-05 15:00 &

12:37PM

3/2272017
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For bidding in any e-tender, click on the event number from the list of live events, select the DSC to
confirm your acceptance of the terms and conditions mentioned in the NIT and Corrigenda .

)| @ hitps:/ /oo mstcecommerce.com/eprochome/ko O = @ & || & Welcome Vendor... x

~
Hi MSTCDS6
'rocurement Event Info 201773722 12
Select Buyer - |Kolkata Port Trust |
Live e-Procurement Events - Live Events
Forthcoming e-Procurement Events * I Forthcomng |
Acknowledgement.. -- Webpage Dialog
e-Procurement Event List} ACKNOWLEDGEMENT
ERrocnemeackyentNad I have read and understood the NIT jr=mencEvasGlaesDas:
& KOPT/KOLKATA DOCI and its CORRIGENDA and satisfied 328 15:00
e myself before bidding 12715:00
HECETEOTEATADOC) Froceed To Sign your acceplance... -IOHD
£ KOPT/KOLKATA DOCI 3-27 14:00
B KOPT/KOLKATA DOCI 324 14:00
£ KOPT/KOLKATA DOC] 328 15:00
© KOPT/KOLKATA DOCI 3-28 15:00
£ KOPT/HALDIA DOCK 3-29 16:00
& KOPT/HALDIA DOCK CUMPLEX/AUNN. DIVILHI0-INE 175y & 28 15:00
0 KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CE/262/16-17/ET/598 2017-03-08 12:00 2017-03-28 15:00
0 KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CE/264/16-17/ET/602 2017-03-1015:00 2017-03-31 15:00
£ KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CE/26516-1WET/603 2017-03-1312:00 2017-04-06 15:00
0 KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CE/266/16-17/ET/604 2017-03-1212:00 2017-03-31 15:00
© KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CME/45/16.17/ET/605 2017-03-1514:00 2017-04-17 14:30
£ KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CE/267/16-17/ET/606 2017-03-1712:00 2017-04-05 15:00 &

1248 PM

L s

Select Buy Select a Certificate

Live e-Proc

Fortheomit | | TATA CONSULTANCY SERVICES

TATA ‘
Select the Certificate you want to use.
Click View Certificate for Certificate Details. Tose Date
Issued To [ 1ssued B: [ Serial No. [ Expiration Date [ Issuer Deta A
[EIMSTCDS14  MSTCDS14 2713E9D6 CN=MSTCD,
[EIMSTCDSE  MSTCDS6 605793BE CN=MSTCD
[ElMsTCDS2  MSTCDS2 687C7594 CN=MSTCD
[EIMSTCDS7 ~ MSTCDS? 0F393565 CN=MSTCD
M CD
>
oK | Cancel I View Certificate
TATA
uvam

Copyright & 2006 Tata Consultancy Services Ltd,

© KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CER66/16-17/ET/604 20170312 12:00 20170331 15:00
U KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CME/45/16-17/ET/605 2017-03-1514:00 2017-04-17 14:30

v
& KOPT/KOLKATA DOCK SYSTEM/CE267/16-1VET/606 2017-03-1712:00 2017-04-0515:00
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- a
O 58 roimmimsucincomsrochamsrnesisim £ - & | @ wecome vendor., <l o 7o B
File Edit View Favorites Tools Help
‘Welcome MSTCDS1 »

Hi MSTCDS1 EVENT INFO

_ . 122017 16:36:14 15T
Events Details Current Server Time:

Event No Event Type Event Start Time

TANGEDCO/CE-Channai

Do you want to run this application?

This will run i

MName: MSTC-eProcurement

Publisher: MSTC Limited

Location:  hitp:/fwaw.mstcauction.com

Event Close Time

Material
E-Tender Technical Cumn Price Bid 01.02.2017 15:55:00 02.02.2017 15:00:00 INR
Management/1/16-
17/ET/2
GmEmey  AvachDocs
Cover s | covera 1 oid saeus
01 Test Itern 01 Techno-Commercial Price No Bid Saved
0z Test Item

Currency

put your computer

(] Ba P shai ik Sasin Tor apes Fom the publisher and lacatian sbave

e More Information
L

information at risk. Run this application only if you trust the location and publisher above.

/v

436 PM

Wait for the JAVA applieati

FHBG®

on to be downloaded on your computer and Run the application by clicking

on the Run button. If there is any problem in the Running of JAVA application, check for the JRE version

installed in the computer and upgrade the same if necessary.

- a
euf:j}‘w‘@ https:/ /. mstcecommerce.com/eprochome/ko O = @ € H & Welcome Vendor... x ‘ o Ty
Welcome MSTCDS6 3

Hi MSTCDS6E

2

Events Details

EVENT INFO

2232017 12:49:40 15T
Current Server Time:

EventNo
KoPT/Kolkata
System/CME/4
17/ET/587

Do you want to run this application?

Name: MSTC-eProcurement

Publisher: MSTC Limited
Location:  https:/fwww.mstcecommerce.com
pART a(1) s| Thisapplcation will run with unrestricted access which may put your computer and personal

information at risk. Run this application only if you trust the lacation and publisher bove.
PART B(1) C:
[ ] Da not shaw this again far apps from the publisher and location abave

g Mare Information

T

INR

b | Bid Status

No Bid Saved

No Bid Saved

This webpage wants to run the following add-on: TCSDCipherl ActiveX Centrol Module' from Tata Co li:

Services Limited
What's the risk?

d pu...'s

.
[ Alow [+

12:50 PM

& o] i RN

32272017

In some cases the website might prompt for an “Add On” to run, which should be allowed.
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To bid in an e-tender, click on the “Techno- Commercial” and “price” links under Cover 1 and Cover 2
respectively and save them for entering your Bid against the desired lot.

e@‘@ https://veww.mstcecommerce.com/eprochome/ko O ~ @ & H (& Welcome Vendor...

welcome MSTCDS6

Hi MSTCDSE EVENT INFO

2232017125236  1ST

Events Details Current Server Time:

Event No Event Type Event Start Time Event Close Time

KoPT/Kolkata Dock
System/PnR/11/16- E-Tender Technical Cum Price Bid ~ 10.03.3017 12:30:00  03.04.2017 1a:00/00
17/ET/586

Attach Docs

Cover 1

Bid Status

No Bid

a1 18 /N Outdoor P camera Techno-Commercial price "

No Bid

Az 1P O/N Qutdoor PTZ calerz Techno-Commercial Price .

No Bid

Bf 1P Based D/N Fixed camers Techno-Commercial  Price  _° "

) o Bid

82 1P Based D/N Fixed camers Techno-Commercial  Price [ "%

. Mo Bid

B2 1P Based D/N Fixed camers Techno-Commercial  Price . ° "

) Mo Bid

Ba 1P Basad D/N Fixed camara Techno-Commercial  Price "%

. Mo Bid

c Indoor HD 2 MP ... (as per BoQ) Techno-Commercial  Price  ° "

No Bid

° NAS storage with ... (2= per BoQ) iachoosCommercialy wabBicaey = vou
No Bid v

E 600 KVA line interactive UPS ... (as par B2Q) Techno-Commercial  Price o "

Some tenders may have “Common/Commercial Specification or Terms”. In those tenders both the
aforesaid links will be activated only after saving the “Common/Commercial Specifications or Terms”

After opening the Tech Cover, fill up the form and click on Save button provided at the bottom of the

page. This will save your bid which you can edit later on. Click on “Allow” if the prompt asks to allow
access from the website. /

& Welcome Vendor... - Windows Internet Explorer [ ==
@O = [&] http://www.mstcauction.com/eprochome/tneb/admin/VendorPanel/vendor_home.jsp <] x| [ 2 8ing o ~|
<ir Favorites | 5l3 ] ecommerce.com @] auction.com g E-PROC DEMO ADMIN L... | E-PROC ADMIN LOGIN Admin Login_DEMO & | Admin Login .
|22 | ~ | @ Transaction Payment Peri... |@We|=ome\rendor... x | | - ~ [7 d=h = Page~ Safety~ Tools~ @@~
% Find: | kallani | Previous Nea |[F] Options - | /

Hi tnebvendor1  ((socurity Wamning Event Info =

Event Details ‘Tl"-| Allow access to the following application from this web site?

Web Site:  http://www.mstcauction.com
Event No.

TNEB/Basin Bridge| Application: UNKNOWN
Station/10/16-17 Publisher:  UNKNOWN

This web site is requesting access and control of the Java agplication shown above. :
Allow access only if you trust the web site and know that tHe application is [show/hide]
intended to run on this site.

Buyer Details

)

b

(PLEASE

IUR QUOTE) 3

[F] Do not show this again for this app and web site.  |__Allow | [__Do Not Allow_]

ITEM INFO : T{ 1) Morsinformation
Pur S SpPECITTCaTIon T g T
1 1.1 TECHNO COMMERCIAL TERMS

n

1 || Test Clause 3 I

2 || Test Clause 4

AGREE

1 minutes and 41 seconds left until page refresh! € Local intranet | Protected Mode: Off YA v W100% -

Blle T T8 Sle ==Ll ] e Bog
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Once a bid has been saved, the Bid Status would change to “Technical Bid Saved” after saving Cover 1

and “Price Saved” after Saving Cover 2. To edit your technical/price bid, click on the links “Techno-
Commercial” and “Price” respectively.

& Welcome Vendor... - Windows Internet Explorer

@O - |g, hittp://www.mstcauction.com/eprochome/tneb/admin/VendorPanel/vendor_home.jsp - | ‘7| > | |,O Bing o '|
- Favorites | i3 &) ecommerce.com @] auction.com g] E-PROC DEMO ADMIN L.. & E-PROC ADMIN LOGIN ] Admin Login_DEMO | Admin Login ”

| @ welcome vendor.. | | - ~ [ dma = Page~ Safety~ Tools~ @~

Welcome MSTCDS1

Hi MSTCDS1 EVENT INFO

2132017 13:745 IST

Events Details Current Server Time:

Event No Event Type

Event Start Time Event Close Time Currency

TNEB/Basin Bridge Gas
Turbine Power

E-Tender Technical Cum Price Bid 15.03.2017 12:42:00
Station/10/16-17/ET/12

22.03.2017 13:00:00 INR

~SommenTerms Attach Docs

Price Bid Successfully Accepted For Lot No. 2

E Final Submission |Withdraw Bid| Delete Bid Bid Status

Test Lot

Techno-Commercial Price Final Submission  Withdraw Bid  Delete Bid | =cnnical

Saved
Test Lot

2 gr— Techno-Commercial Price Final Submission ‘Withdraw Bid Delete Bid Price Saved

1= 0 = 1 I 2T N —

3/21/2017 |

To quote the price bid, click on the link “Price” under cover 2. As you fill the required fields, the system

displays the site cost per unit and total site cost as alerts. The price bid can be saved and edited
subsequently through the same link.

F. Upload Documents

Please select the ‘Attach Docs’ link to upload documents. Multiple documents can be uploaded.
- o
Q@@ T mm.-zpmhmg.-mbfadm\o\- ¢ || @ weicome vendor... = {3

File Edit View Favorites Tools Help

Welcome MSTCDS1

EVENT INFO
1.2.2017 16:36:56 ST

Events Details Current Server Time:

Event Type

Event Start Time

Event Close Time Currency
TANGEDCO/CE-Channai

Material

ENander Technical Cum Price Bid 01.02.2017 15:55:00  02.02.2017 15:00:00
Management/1/16-
17782

mr

WSemmenTerms,, Attach Docs
o1 Test Itern 01 Techno-Commercial Price No Bid Saved
02 Test Iterm 02 Techno-Commercial Price No Bid Saved

Final Submission

2= =S

N o () D A3TPM
SRt " e

Page 28 of 32



& Welcome Vendor... - Windows Internet Explorer | ||
6@ =[] http://10.1.6.85/eprochome/tneb/admin/VendorPanel/vendor_home,jsp ~[ 4+ [ x| [ 2 Bing o |
7ir Favorites | i3 @) E-PROC DEMO ADMIN L. @] E-PROC ADMIN LOGIN & Admin Login_DEMO & Admin Login & MSTC PRA SIGN-IN €§ Contact Details .
| @& welcome vendor... [ | - ~ [ mmm ~ Page~ Safety~ Tools~ i@~
Welcome MSTCDS1 »
[T ]I have no document to attach.
4
Browse for File To Upload: Browse:
Upload
Back To Floor
I

1 minutes and 54 seconds left until page refresh! I +/ Trusted sites | Protected Mode: Off 5 ~ | ®|100% ~

Elelolololel=]s] L

Once a bidder selects ‘I have no documents to attach’ and click on ‘submit’ the “Attach Docs” link gets
disabled for that event. This option may be exercised in case the bidder does not wish to attach any

supporting documents.

In case a bidder selects ‘I have no documents to attach’ by mistake, it may use the ‘Delete no Doc’ link to
enable the ‘Attach Doc’ button and upload the documents

.-
[ €[OI TR 1) = pyee— <[ 5 7 55

File Edit View Favorites Tools Help

Welcome MSTCDS6 ‘ Welcome MSTCDS6

=[] vendor Home..
&[] koPTVENDORL..
=[] My Menu

Download HIT/Corrigendum
Pre-Bid Meeting Report

|| PRE BID MEET VENDOR

E AUC FLOOR MANGR

VIEW PROFILE

|| Technical csT

Price CST

Delete NoDocs

|| Transaction Fee Payment

1210PM
3/22/2007

- o EH B B
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G.Final Submission

Once the technical and price bids have been filled and documents have been uploaded and you feel that
you won't edit them any further, you are required to submit the bid by clicking on Final submission
button which shall be highlighted. Once the said button is clicked and the data is digitally signed with
bidder’s Digital Signature, the bid stands submitted and no further editing of the bid is possible
thereafter.

& Welcome Vendor... - Windows Internet Explorer

& () = [£] netprrwww.mstcauction.com/eprochomertneb/admin/VendorPanel/vendor_home.jsp ~[42[ x| [2 8ing
<l Faworites | 5l ] ecommerce.com ] auction.com | E-PROC DEMO ADMIN L... ] E-PROC ADMIN LOGIN ] Admin Login_DEMO 4] Admin Login >
| & welcome vendor... [ | i - ~ [ @=h -~ Page~ Safety~ Tools~ @~

Welcome MS

Hi MSTd 2 | Bid Signer - Webpage Dialog (===

Erens baisis This is your final submission, no correction / addition / uploading etc

can be carried out after this. Please confirm to proceed...

Event No
TMEB/Basin Bridge Gas PLS. SIGN THE BID WITH YOUR REGISTERED DSC

Turbine Power [ Procesd To Sign Your Bid_ | R
Station/10/16-17/ET/12

-SommonTerms,, Attach Docs

Price Bid Successfully Accepted For Lot No. 2

rinol Submission |withdraw nia|_petete pia | bid Statu-

Techno-Cemmercial Price Final Submission  Withdraw Bid Delete Big 1 ochnical

Saved

z :eSt Lot Techno-Commercial Price

withdraw Bid Delete Bid Price Saved

e || RENEEAE A EEN TS e

€2 Welcome Vendor... - Windows Internet Explorer

@\J < [&] nttprwww.mstcauction.com/ eprocherme/tnab/admin/VandorPansl vander_home.isp ~[4+] x| [2 Bing o ~|
<l Favorites | 53 i2) ecommerce.com (2] auction.com =] E-PROC DEMO ADMIN L.. ] E-PROC ADMIN LOGIN =] Admin Login_DEMO ] Admin Login =
| & welcome vendor... [ | % ~ B ~ 1 @ ~ Page~ Safety~ Tools~ @~

Welcome MSTCDS1

Select a Certificate

Hi MSTCDS1

Events Details

Current Server Ti| TATA CONSULTANCY SERVICES TA'I"I\—‘

Event No
TMNEB/Basin Bridge Gas
Turbine Power E-Tender Technical o
Station/10/16-17/ET/12

Event Type
Select the Certificate you want to use.

Click View Certificate for Certificate Details.

Issued To [[1ssued & [ serial no. [ Expiration Date [ 1ssuer Deta ~
EIMsSTCDST MSTCDS7 0F393565 05-05-2024 CN=MSTCD

WSemmon Terms Attach Docs [EIPFC_DEMO... PFC_DEMO_U2 433ED7DA 31-12-2020 FC_oi
ElMmsTCDss MSTCDSS SECES4CE sTCD
Price B ElmsTCcDs12 MSTCDS12 5700781E STCD

Cover 1 . """"""" S
MNal rrr >
IeSt Lot o Commercial oK 1 cancel | wiew certificate

Test Lot

2 5 Techno-Commercial : T
/a'll’LNa n

Copyright @ 2006 Tata Consultancy Services Led.

1:08 PM

3/21/2017

@ || Ol e | @ = e
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& Welcome Vendor... - Windows Intemet Explorer EI@

@u L |g, hittp://www.mstcauction.com/eprochome/tneb/admin/VendorPanel/vendor_home.jsp - | 3 | X | |,Q Bing R v|

53

i} Favorites | ’i:n‘B & ecommerce.com g | auction.com @& E-PROCDEMO ADMIN L... & E-PROC ADMIN LOGIN & | Admin Login_DEMO g | Admin Login
|§We|come‘u"endor.‘. Message from webpage @ Page v Safety > Teols~ @' 7

. Data Has Been Digitally Signed By The Certificate Selected
é MIKAWY)KoZlhweNAQcColl3DCCCFACAQEXCzAIBgUrDgMCGgUAMIEFQYIKeZI

hveNAQcBolEBgSCEBANldmVudHdpc2UISHRIbXdpc2UmYXViX3)IZI9pZ D0y ODEL
ImFLY19yZWZfbmBaVESFQilyRk]hc2luKDlyaWRnZStHYXMrVHVyYmluZ5tQb3dl

cit TdGFOaWIuI TIGMTAIMIYxMNi0xMNy Uy RIVUITIGMTImaXRIbY 9y ZWZfaWRmalW5h
bD0yOTU205Zhd WNf3RFAGHZT0xNS4wMydyMDESKZEy  TNBMDIMOEWMCZhd WNF
Y2 d GRZTOyMidwiMydyMDE3KzEzI TNBMDAIMOEWMCZwemluY2lwYWefemVmx 25y
PVRORUImcH)pbmMpcGFsX3)IZI9pZD02NiZhd WNOXER5 cGUINIZhdWNOX2RIc2MS

RS1UZWSKZXIrVGVjaG5pY2FsKONL bStQemiiZStCaWQmeaVweGrpZXfermymx2lk
PTK2NyZmaW5hbGlpZD1wImRpZ2I0Y Wik XRhPWV2ZW50d21zZSUzRENZW13aXNI

TNEE/Basir| ITRVXVGIZOpZCUzRDEMTUIMIZhdWNfemVmX25vITNEVESFQillyNT)GQmFz

Turbine Po; aWAIMKICcmikZ2UIMKIHYXMIMIIU diaWs U TICUGO3ZXIMKIT dGF0aWouI TH INR

Station/ 10, MEYxMCUyNTIGMTYEMT cIMjLy REVUITI MEYxMily NmIOZW1 femVmX2IkZmluY Wl

MOQyOTU205UyNmFLY19zdFI0aWLITNEMTUuMDMubdjlsMy Uy QjEy T MOEOMiUly
NTNEMDAIMZhdWNFY2xf d G ZSUzRDIy LjAzLiTwMT clMidMy Uy NTMNBMDAIM]Uz
w QTaAWITRZcHlpbmMNpcGFsX3)IZ13ubyUzRFRORUIMjZwemluY 2w WademVm X2k
JTHEN}YIMZhdWMNOXER5cGUIMOQ2ITI2ZYXVjdFOZXMITNERSTUZWSKZ XML
ZWNobmIYWwIMKIDdWOIMK QemiiZSUy QklpZ CUyNlL cHBsaW\Vy X3 IZI9pZCUz

E RDK2NyUyNmZpbrmFeYmik TNECC Uy NmRpZ2I0 YWk YXRhITNEIT2 c2InbrmVkZ GFO -
¥SUZRCUYNmVUY3J5cHRIZCUZRGAIMIZTeW1LZXKIMORyRTI2c05L d3czN2N1 NmRU Bid Status
L MVIORURRITI MOQIMUZRC Uy NmVul3HS2V5 ITNEITIZbrmOsh 3Rz TNEMiUyNIRp
. Iss BWUIMOQyMDE3LT Azl ThL TEzLjA3Lj QyInNpZ25IZGRhdGESImVuY3)ScHRIZD1u Lchnical
JINSbUHET1yRTI205L d3czN2N1 NmRUMVIORURRITNE TNE) mYuU31t52V5PSZu ved
e b2sovdHMIMIZUaWLIPThwMTctMDMEMIEEMTMUMD cuNDKggg OxMIDI TCCApWaAwIE
2 AglEKXxhzzANBgkghkiGIw0BAQsFADE/MQswCQVDVQQGEW/OTDELMAKGAL UECEMC ice Saved

ROExKTAnBgMNVBACTIDyNSEDIEEUSISDIEhc2U gUmBhZ CBLTOxL QVREL ThwMRIw
EAYDVQQKEwWINULRDIEZ C4xEjAQBgNVBASTCULTVEMg THRELJEQMA4 GAT UEAxMH
TVMNUQORTMTAeFu(xNDAL MjgwND Q4 MzFaFuwlyNDASMDkwND Q4 MzFalMHExCzAIBgMNY
BAYTAKSMMQswCQYDVQQIEWIHQTEpMCcGAL UEBMgMTIIEMg Q55KLKMgQmBzZ5B5
b2FkIEtPTEtBVEEM]AXEJAQBgNVBACTCUL TVEMg THRELJESMBAGATUECkMITYNU
QyBMdGQuMRAWDgYDVQQDEwdNUIRDRFMxMIBLANBglkghkiGSw0EB...

el Slorlu]@]i=]re]i] T 0 g

g@\@ hitps://vouromsteecommerce.com/eprochome/m O - @ G || 11 (WARNING: MESSAGE ENCRYP... & Weicome Vendor. ~ |l A

File Edit View Favorites Tools Help

Welcome MSTCDSZ

EVENT INFO
2232017 15:29:46  IST

Events Details Current Server Time:

Event No Event Type Event Start Time  Event Close Time  Currency

MSTC/15-16/ET/DEMO E-Tendar Technical Cum Price Bid 02.07.2015 17:00:00  31.03.2017 11:00:00  INR

—Sommer Serafiemenz,  Attach Docs

Final Bid Succegsfully Submited

ot NolLot Namel ____cover1 [ Cover 2 |rina. _ubmission|withdraw Bid|_Delete Bid_|_sid Status

o1 TEST ITEM  Techno-C Price i Withdraw Bid  Delete Bid  Bid submitted

o %30PM
3/22/2017

= B =i

A message shall be displayed as “Final Bid Successfully Submyitted” and the links for Technical and Price
Bids will get disabled. The Bid Status shall be updated as ‘Bid Submitted’.
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Bidders will receive an acknowledgement mail in their registered email id against each tender after final
submission against each lot

Bidders are required to take special note of the following points.

(a) A bid can be edited any number of times and documents can be uploaded before the final
submission of bid (i.e before clicking on Sign & Encrypt). Once the bid has been submitted by
clicking on Final Submission with its DSC, no further editing of bid or uploading of documents
is possible.

(b) A bid can be submitted up to the scheduled closing time of the event. After the closing time of
event has passed, no bid will be accepted by the system. Hence, bidders are advised to make
final submission of their bids well in advance.

(c) A bid can be withdrawn or deleted with its DSC prior to the closing time of the event.
However in case of withdrawal of bid, no fresh bid can be submitted. On the other hand if a
bidder wishes to edit its bid after final submission he may do so by clicking the “Delete Bid”
button with its DSC and re-submit his bid
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