

Bidder's Guide for Stage I bidding for e-auction of Coal Mines For Commercial Mining

(The following section is meant only to provide guidance to bidders about the bidding process on the website of MSTC. These guidelines are subject to change from time to time depending on the development of the portal. Bidders are advised to keep checking the latest guidelines from the website to keep themselves updated. They may also contact the offices of MSTC to seek clarification on any point. MSTC shall not be responsible for any mistake committed by any bidder or for any consequent loss to the bidder due to mis-understanding anything written hereunder.)

Website: <https://www.mstcecommerce.com/auctionhome/coalblock/index.jsp>

Login: Bidder has to login with user id and password here. The radio button 'Bidder' has to be selected.

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
MINISTRY OF COAL
(An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Ministry)

एम एस टी सी
लिमिटेड
MSTC LIMITED

NOMINATED AUTHORITY
AUCTION OF COAL MINES FOR SALE OF COAL

LATEST ANNOUNCEMENTS Latest Announcements |

EARLIER ANNOUNCEMENTS Earlier Announcements |

Registration

Login

Userid

Password

Bidder NA TCM

Verification Code: f8c1e

CAPTCH

Login

Forgot Password

List of Coal Mines for Auction

Mine Summary of Coal Mines

Notifications/Notices

Timelines

Result

Standard Tender Document

Standard CMDPA

Response to Queries

Corrigendum & Addendum

Standard Vesting Order

ARCHIVES

Home Page:

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
MINISTRY OF COAL
(An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Ministry)

एम एस टी सी
लिमिटेड
MSTC LIMITED

NOMINATED AUTHORITY
AUCTION OF COAL MINES FOR SALE OF COAL

Home | About Us | www.mstcindia.co.in | Help | Contact Us | Logout

cbuser3 You last logged in at :: 2020-06-17 14:48:45.172669 | Login IP :10.1.3.221

in their own interest may change their password periodically

e AUCTION

Click for Auctions >

Change Password

General T&C

Buyer T&C

e- Payment

Download Mine Dossier

Comments/Suggestions

Add EUP

View EUP

Register DSC

For Any Assistance Mail At: coalblock@mstcindia.co.in

Copyright © MSTC LIMITED 2014

Register DSC :

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
MINISTRY OF COAL
(An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Ministry)

NOMINATED AUTHORITY
AUCTION OF COAL MINES FOR SALE OF COAL

Home | About Us | www.mstcindia.co.in | Help | Contact Us | Logout

cbuser3 You last logged in at :: 2020-06-17 14:48:45.172669 | Login IP :10.1.3.221

Change their password periodically

Click for Auctions

Change Password	General T&C	Buyer T&C
e- Payment	Download Mine Dossier	Comments/Suggestions
Add EUP	View EUP	Register DSC

For Any Assistance Mail At: coalblock@mstcindia.co.in

Copyright © MSTC LIMITED 2014

[Home](#) | [Back](#)

Register/Verify your Digital Certificate

I WANT TO REGISTER MY DSC TO PARTICIPATE IN COAL BLOCK AUCTION : Contact
Person :MSTCDS3
eMail :pnaskar@mstcindia.co.in
Tele :9681153467
Mobile :
PAN :FGHJU6543C
PrinciplId :
REGISTERED DSC SERIAL NO. :6e3f2a2e

REGISTERED CERTIFICATE DETAILS :
CERT_SERIAL_NO :6E3F2A2E
CERT_EXPIRY_TIME :2024-09-09 00:00:00.0
SIG_ALGO :SHA256WITHRSAENCRYPTION
CERT STATUS :ACTIVE
CERT REGISTERED ON :2015-01-08 15:59:01.88845

Register/Verify your Digital Certificate

Select a Certificate

TATA CONSULTANCY SERVICES

Select the Certificate you want to use.
Click View Certificate for Certificate Details.

Issued To	Issued By	Serial No.	Expiration Date	Issuer Data
MSTCDS15	MSTCDS15	357F92B3	09-09-2024 :...	CN=MSTCD
MSTCDS4	MSTCDS4	68BF8D1	09-09-2024 :...	CN=MSTCD
dhemajitcm2	dhemajitcm2	745D676A	14-09-2028 :...	CN=dhema
MSTCDS3	MSTCDS3	6E3F2A2E	09-09-2024 :...	CN=MSTCB
dhemajitcm1	dhemajitcm1	624ADE4C	14-09-2028 :...	CN=dhema

OK Cancel View Certificate


Thruvam
TATA CONSULTANCY SERVICES

Copyright © 2006 Tata Consultancy Services Ltd.

I WANT TO
Person :M
eMail :pna
Tele :9681
Mobile :
PAN :FGH
Principal
REGISTER

REGISTE
CERT S
CERT E
SIG ALI
CERT S
CERT R

Message from webpage

 Certificate and Digital Signature Verified Successfully .

OK

Bidding and Upload/Attach Documents

Bidder has to click on 'Click for Auction' button : followed by Stage I bid Submission.
There are three links- Bid Floor Manager, Upload Documents, Attach Documents.

The image displays two screenshots of the MSTC Limited website interface. Both screenshots feature a header with the Ministry of Coal logo and the text 'MINISTRY OF COAL (An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Ministry)'. Below the header, a banner reads 'NOMINATED AUTHORITY AUCTION OF COAL MINES FOR SALE OF COAL'. A navigation bar includes links for Home, About Us, www.mstcindia.co.in, Help, Contact Us, and Logout. A user status bar shows 'cbuser3 You last logged in at :: 2020-06-17 14:48:45.172669 | Login IP :10.1.3.221'.

The first screenshot shows the 'Welcome To Coal Mine Auction' page. It features a large 'e AUCTION' logo with a mouse cursor. Below the logo, there are two main buttons: 'STAGE I BID SUBMISSION' (with a coal cart icon) and 'FORWARD AUCTION' (with a gavel icon). The text 'Stage I Bid Submission' and 'Forward Auction' is displayed below their respective icons. A copyright notice 'Copyright © MSTC LIMITED 2014' is at the bottom.

The second screenshot shows the 'My Menu' page. It features the same 'e AUCTION' logo. Below the logo, the text 'My Menu' and 'Stage I Bid Submission' is displayed. There are three main buttons: 'BID FLOOR MANAGER' (with a gavel icon), 'UPLOAD DOCUMENTS' (with a document icon), and 'ATTACH DOCUMENTS' (with a document icon). The text 'Bid Floor Manager', 'Upload Documents', and 'Attach Documents' is displayed below their respective icons. A copyright notice 'Copyright © MSTC LIMITED 2014' is at the bottom.

Upload of Documents: Bidder has to upload the documents in the Upload Documents link. Bidder has to click on 'Upload files', followed by browsing files, naming the corresponding files and click on Submit. Bidder may repeat the process in order to upload more files.

[Back](#)

File Upload : Upload File(s)

Search By Title

	TYPE	UPLOAD DATE	FILE TITLE	REMOVE
	pdf	2020-03-18	Title1	Remove
	pdf	2020-03-18	Title2	Remove
	pdf	2020-03-18	Title3	Remove
	pdf	2020-03-18	Title1	Remove
	pdf	2020-03-18	Title2	Remove
	pdf	2020-03-18	Title3	Remove
	pdf	2020-03-18	Title1	Remove

Upload Documents

- Title1
- File1:

- Title2
- File2:

- Title3
- File3:

[Back](#)

File Upload : Upload File(s)

Search By Title

SL NO.	FILE NAME	TYPE	UPLOAD DATE	FILE TITLE	REMOVE
1	demodoc1.pdf	pdf	2020-03-18	Title1	Remove
2	demodoc2.pdf	pdf	2020-03-18	Title2	Remove
3	demodoc3.pdf	pdf	2020-03-18	Title3	Remove
4	demodoc4.pdf	pdf	2020-03-18	Title1	Remove
5	demodoc5.pdf	pdf	2020-03-18	Title2	Remove
6	demodoc6.pdf	pdf	2020-03-18	Title3	Remove
7	demodoc7.pdf	pdf	2020-03-18	Title1	Remove

Attach Documents: The files uploaded in 'Upload Documents' link shall be available in this link. Bidder has to select the particular event ,

Attach Documents

Event to attach file: MSTC/HQ/Nominated Authority/33/New Delhi/20-21/189

[Go to Bid Floor](#)

Attach files for the following documents:

Sl.No.	Documents to be attached	Action	File attached (Click file name to download & check)
1	AoA	<input type="button" value="Attach"/>	
2	PoA	<input type="button" value="Attach"/>	
3	Others (Optional)	<input type="button" value="Attach"/>	

Copyright © MSTC LIMITED 2014

Select the file from the list of files uploaded and click on 'Attach'.

Select File to attach

Event No: MSTC/HQ/Nominated Authority/46/New Delhi/20-21/206
Document Name: PoA

Sl. No.	File Name	File Type	File Title	Select File
1	demodoc1.pdf	pdf	Title1	<input type="checkbox"/>
2	demodoc2.pdf	pdf	Title2	<input type="checkbox"/>
3	demodoc3.pdf	pdf	Title3	<input type="checkbox"/>
4	demodoc4.pdf	pdf	Title1	<input type="checkbox"/>
5	demodoc5.pdf	pdf	Title2	<input type="checkbox"/>
6	demodoc6.pdf	pdf	Title3	<input type="checkbox"/>
7	demodoc7.pdf	pdf	Title1	<input type="checkbox"/>

Copyright © MSTC LIMITED 2014

Note: The bidder has to attach documents as per the list displayed against the respective auction. The bidder can attach only one file against a document. Same file cannot be attached for more than one document. Multiple files cannot be attached for one document. If required the bidder may attach one additional file through the 'Others' option.

In order to remove the file from the selected event, bidder has to select the event and click on 'Detach' against respective files

Attach Documents

Event to attach file: MSTC/HO/Nominated Authority/33/New Delhi/20-21/189

[Go to Bid Floor](#)

Attach files for the following documents:

SI.No.	Documents to be attached	Action	File attached (Click file name to download & check)
1	AoA	<input type="button" value="Detach"/>	demodoc1.pdf
2	PoA	<input type="button" value="Detach"/>	demodoc2.pdf
3	Others (Optional)	<input type="button" value="Attach"/>	

Note: Bidder cannot submit his bid without attaching the mandatory documents.

Bid Floor Manager :

Bidder has to click on Live Auctions followed by selecting the particular tender.

**GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
MINISTRY OF COAL
(An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Ministry)**

**NOMINATED AUTHORITY
AUCTION OF COAL MINES FOR SALE OF COAL**

Home | About Us | www.mstcindia.co.in | Help | Contact Us | Logout

cbuser3 You last logged in at :: 2020-06-17 14:48:45.172669 | Login IP :10.1.3.221

AUCTION

BID FLOOR MANAGER


Stage I Bid Submission


LIVE AUCTIONS


[Click Here](#)

No	Name	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Bid Status
1	Utkal B 1	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	No Bid Saved

A bidder has to wait for the JAVA application pop-up box to display and run the application by clicking on the 'Run' button. If there is any problem in the Running of JAVA application, check for the JRE version installed in the computer and upgrade the same if necessary.


GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
MINISTRY OF COAL
 (An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Ministry)


एम एस टी सी लिमिटेड
MSTC LIMITED
 A GOVT. OF INDIA ENTERPRISE

Security Warning
 Do you want to run this application?

Publisher: UNKNOWN
Location: http://cma.mstcauction.com

Running this application may be a security risk
Risk: This application will run with unrestricted access which may put your computer and personal information at risk. The information provided is unreliable or unknown so it is recommended not to run this application unless you are familiar with its source.
[More Information](#)

Select the box below, then click Run to start the application
 I accept the risk and want to run this application.


Home
 cbuser3
 HI MSTCDS3


Events Details
Event No
 MSTC/HO/Nominated Authority/71/New Delhi/20-21/311


0.1.3.221
 Back

No	Name	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Bid Status
1	Utkal B 1	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	No Bid Saved

Close Time: 2020 14:30:00
 Currency: %


GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
MINISTRY OF COAL
 (An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Ministry)


एम एस टी सी लिमिटेड
MSTC LIMITED
 A GOVT. OF INDIA ENTERPRISE

Security Warning
 Do you want to run this application?

Name: Bouncy Castle Provider
Publisher: UNKNOWN
Location: http://cma.mstcauction.com

Running this application may be a security risk
Risk: This application will run with unrestricted access which may put your computer and personal information at risk. The information provided is unreliable or unknown so it is recommended not to run this application unless you are familiar with its source.
[More Information](#)

Select the box below, then click Run to start the application
 I accept the risk and want to run this application.

Home
 cbuser3
 HI MSTCDS3

Events Details
Event No
 MSTC/HO/Nominated Authority/71/New Delhi/20-21/311

0.1.3.221
 Back

No	Name	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Bid Status
1	Utkal B 1	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	No Bid Saved

Close Time: 2020 14:30:00
 Currency: %

Java Console

```

h: display the help message
l: dump classloader list
m: print memory usage
o: trigger logging
q: hide console
r: reload policy configuration
s: dump system and deployment properties
t: dump thread list
v: dump thread stack
x: clear classloader cache
0-9: set trace level to <n>

```

Missing Application-Name manifest attribute for: http://cma.mstcauction.com/au...
CacheEntry[http://cr13.digicert.com/psca-sha2-g6.crl]: updateAvailable=true, lastMod...
CacheEntry[http://cr14.digicert.com/DigiCertAssuredIDRootCA.crl]: updateAvailable=...
CacheEntry[http://cr13.digicert.com/psca-sha2-assured-cs-g1.crl]: updateAvailable=true, li...
Missing Permissions manifest attribute in main jar: http://cma.mstcauction.com/au...
CacheEntry[http://cr13.digicert.com/DigiCertAssuredIDRootCA.crl]: updateAvailable=...
CacheEntry[http://cr13.digicert.com/DigiCertAssuredIDCA-1.crl]: updateAvailable=tr...
Enable Encryption Applet Initialized
Enable Encryption Applet Started

ender_tech_bid_user.jsp

PROCUREMENT ... MSTC PNA SIGN-IN DEMO SCRAP Admin Login LIVE SCRAP Admin Login DEMO Welcome to MSTC ... 10.1.6.85 10.1.6.165

NOMINATED AUTHORITY
AUCTION OF COAL MINES FOR SALE OF COAL

www.mstcindia.co.in | Help | Contact Us | Logout

You last logged in at :: 2020-06-17 14:48:45.172669 | Login IP :10.1.3.221

Hi MSTCDS3 **EVENT INFO** Back

Events Details		Current Server Time:	18.6.2020 13:18:11 IST		
Event No	Event Type	Event Start Time	Event Close Time	Currency	
MSTC/HO/Nominated Authority/71/New Delhi/20-21/311	Stage I Bid Submission	18.06.2020 13:15:00	27.06.2020 14:30:00	%	

No	Name	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Bid Status
1	Utkal B 1	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	No Bid Saved

Final Submission Attach Document

Bidder shall submit the Technical Cover by clicking 'Save' button followed by 'OK'.

Hi testcb4 Back

Event Details		Server Time : 2020/6/2 12:23:9			
Event No.	Event Type	Event Start Date	Event Close Date	Currency	
MSTC/HO/Nominated Authority/33/New Delhi/20-21/189	Stage I Bid Submission	02.06.2020 12:21:00	2020-06-02 12:30:00.0	%	

(PLEASE ENTER ALL VALUES AND CLICK ON SAVE BUTTON TO SAVE YOUR QUOTE)

Coal Mine : Utkal B 1 Coal Mine

1 TECHNICAL TERMS

1	As per mine summary.	AGREE
---	----------------------	-------

Saver

Hi testcb4 Back

Event Details					Server Time :
					2020/6/2 12:23:13
Event No.	Event Type	Event Start Date	Event Close Date	Currency	
MSTC/HO/Nominated Authority/33/New Delhi/20-21/189	Stage I Bid Submission	02.06.2020 12:21:00	2020-06-02 12:30:00.0	%	

Message from webpage
If you want to submit now, then click on OK

OK Cancel

Coal Mine : Utkal B 1 Coal Mine

1 TECHNICAL TERMS

1	As per mine summary.	AGREE
---	----------------------	-------

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
MINISTRY OF COAL
(An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Ministry)

एन एस टी सी
लिमिटेड
MSTC
LIMITED

NOMINATED AUTHORITY
AUCTION OF COAL MINES FOR SALE OF COAL

Home | About Us | www.mstcindia.co.in | Help | Contact Us | Logout

testcb4 You last logged in at :: 2020-06-01 17:40:02.961668 | Login IP :192.168.43.160

Hi MSTCDS8 EVENT INFO Back

Events Details		Current Server Time:			
		2.6.2020 12:23:21	IST		
Event No.	Event Type	Event Start Time	Event Close Time	Currency	
MSTC/HO/Nominated Authority/33/New Delhi/20-21/189	Stage I Bid Submission	02.06.2020 12:21:00	02.06.2020 12:30:00	%	

Technical Bid Successfully Accepted

No	Name	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Bid Status
1	Utkal B 1	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Technical Bid Saved

Final Submission Attach Document

Once a technical bid has been saved, the Bid Status would change to “Technical Bid Saved”. Once the Technical Bid is saved, bidder has to click the “Initial Offer” to enter the initial offer.

Hi MSTCDS8 Back

Event Details					Server Time :
					2020/6/2 12:24:7
Event No.	Event Type	Event Start Date	Event Close Date	Currency	
MSTC/HO/Nominated Authority/33/New Delhi/20-21/189	Stage I Bid Submission	02.06.2020 12:21:00	2020-06-02 12:30:00.0	%	

Initial Offer

PLEASE ENTER ALL VALUES AND CLICK ON SAVE BUTTON TO SAVE YOUR QUOTE

Utkal B 1 Coal Mine

Revenue Sharing in Percentage	4.5	X
-------------------------------	-----	---

Initial Offer Four Point Fifty

Save

Hi MSTCDS8 [Back](#)

Event Details		Server Time : 2020/6/2 12:24:45		
Event No.	Event Type	Event Start Date	Event Close Date	Currency
MSTC/HO/Nominated Authority/33/New Delhi/20-21/189	Stage I Bid Submission	02.06.2020 12:21:00	2020-06-02 12:30:00.0	%

Message from webpage


Initial Offer 4.50

PLEASE ENTER ALL VALUES AND CLICK ON SAVE BUTTON TO SAVE


Utkal B 1 Coal Mine

Revenue Sharing in Percentage

Initial Offer Four Point Fifty



GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
MINISTRY OF COAL
(An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Ministry)



एम एस टी सी
लिमिटेड
MSTC LIMITED

NOMINATED AUTHORITY
AUCTION OF COAL MINES FOR SALE OF COAL

Home | About Us | www.mstcindia.co.in | Help | Contact Us | Logout

testcb4 You last logged in at :: 2020-06-01 17:40:02.961668 | Login IP :192.168.43.160

Hi MSTCDS8 [Back](#)

Events Details		Current Server Time: 2.6.2020 12:24:33 IST		
Event No	Event Type	Event Start Time	Event Close Time	Currency
MSTC/HO/Nominated Authority/33/New Delhi/20-21/189	Stage I Bid Submission	02.06.2020 12:21:00	02.06.2020 12:30:00	%

Initial Price Offer Successfully Accepted

No	Name	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Bid Status
1	Utkal B 1	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Initial Offer Saved

Once a price bid has been saved, the Bid Status would change to “Initial Offer Saved”.

To edit the technical/price bid, bidder has to click on the links “Technical Bid” and “Initial Offer” respectively.

Once the technical and price bids have been saved and the bidder feels that there are no any further changes, bidder has to submit the bid by clicking on Final submission button. Once the said button is clicked and the data is digitally signed with bidder's Digital Signature, the bid stands submitted and no further editing of the bid is possible thereafter.

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
MINISTRY OF COAL
 (An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Ministry)

NOMINATED AUTHORITY

Bid Signer-- Web page Dialogue

This is your final submission. Please make sure to upload and attach documents as per Tender before bid closing time. Please confirm to proceed...

Please sign the bid with your registered DSC

Proceed To Sign Your Bid...

Event No	Event Type	Event Start Time	Event Close Time	Currency
MSTC/HO/Nominated Authority/71/New Delhi/20-21/311	Stage I Bid Submission	18.06.2020 13:15:00	27.06.2020 14:30:00	%

No	Name	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Bid Status
1	Utkal B 1	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Initial Offer Saved

Final Submission Attach Document

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
MINISTRY OF COAL
 (An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Ministry)

Select a Certificate

TATA CONSULTANCY SERVICES

Select the Certificate you want to use.
 Click View Certificate for Certificate Details.

Issued To	Issued By	Serial No.	Expiration Date	Issuer Data
MSTCDS15	MSTCDS15	3579283	09-09-2024	... CN=MSTCD
MSTCDS4	MSTCDS4	688F8BD1	09-09-2024	... CN=MSTCD
dhemajitcm2	dhemajitcm2	745D676A	14-09-2028	... CN=dhema
MSTCDS5	MSTCDS5	0987297C	09-09-2024	... CN=MSTCD
dhemajitcm1	dhemajitcm1	624AD54C	14-09-2028	... CN=dhema

OK Cancel View Certificate

Chuvam
 Copyright © 2006 Tata Consultancy Services Ltd.

Event No	Event Type	Event Start Time	Event Close Time	Currency
MSTC/HO/Nominated Delhi/20-21/311	Stage I Bid Submission	18.06.2020 13:15:00	27.06.2020 14:30:00	%

No	Name	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Bid Status
1	Utkal B 1	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Initial Offer Saved

Final Submission Attach Document

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
MINISTRY OF COAL
(An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Ministry)

NOMINATED AUTHORITY
AUCTION OF COAL MINES FOR SALE OF COAL

Home | About Us | www.mstcindia.co.in | Help | Contact Us | Logout

cbuser3 You last logged in at :: 2020-06-17 14:48:45.172669 | Login IP :10.1.3.221

Hi MSTCDS3

Message from webpage

! Data Has Been Digitally Signed By The Certificate Selected

Back

Event No	Event Type	Event Start Time	Event Close Time	Currency
MSTC/HO/Nominated Authority/71/New Delhi/20-21/311	Stage I Bid Submission	18.06.2020 13:15:00	27.06.2020 14:30:00	%

No	Name	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Bid Status
1	Utkal B 1	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Initial Offer Saved

Final Submission Attach Document

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
MINISTRY OF COAL
(An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Ministry)

NOMINATED AUTHORITY
AUCTION OF COAL MINES FOR SALE OF COAL

Home | About Us | www.mstcindia.co.in | Help | Contact Us | Logout

cbuser3 You last logged in at :: 2020-06-17 14:48:45.172669 | Login IP :10.1.3.221

Hi MSTCDS3

EVENT INFO

Back

Event No	Event Type	Event Start Time	Event Close Time	Currency
MSTC/HO/Nominated Authority/71/New Delhi/20-21/311	Stage I Bid Submission	18.06.2020 13:15:00	27.06.2020 14:30:00	%

Final Bid Successfully Submitted

No	Name	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Bid Status
1	Utkal B 1	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Bid submitted

Final Submission Withdraw Bid Delete Bid Attach Document

Bidder can Withdraw/Delete his bid at any time before the 'Event Close Time'. Bid once withdrawn cannot be submitted again. Bidder has to delete his bid in order to submit his bid again.

Note: Bidder can use the 'Attach Document' link available on the bid-floor to attach document. Once the documents are attached, clicking on 'Go To Bid Floor' will take the bidder back to the bid-floor.

GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
MINISTRY OF COAL
(An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Ministry)

NOMINATED AUTHORITY
AUCTION OF COAL MINES FOR SALE OF COAL

Home | About Us | www.mstcindia.co.in | Help | Contact Us | Logout

cbuser3 You last logged in at :: 2020-06-17 14:48:45.172669 | Login IP :10.1.3.221

Hi MSTCDS3

EVENT INFO

Back

Event No	Event Type	Event Start Time	Event Close Time	Currency
MSTC/HO/Nominated Authority/71/New Delhi/20-21/311	Stage I Bid Submission	18.06.2020 13:15:00	27.06.2020 14:30:00	%

No	Name	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Bid Status
1	Utkal B 1	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Initial Offer Saved

Please attach all the documents to enable submit button.

Final Submission Attach Document

NOMINATED AUTHORITY
AUCTION OF COAL MINES FOR SALE OF COAL

[Home](#) | [About Us](#) | [www.mstcindia.co.in](#) | [Help](#) | [Contact Us](#) | [Logout](#)

cbuser3 You last logged in at :: 2020-06-17 14:48:45.172669 | Login IP :10.1.3.221

Attach Documents

Event to attach file: MSTC/HO/Nominated Authority/71/New Delhi/20-21/311

[Go to Bid Floor](#)

Attach files for the following documents:

Sl.No.	Documents to be attached	Action	File attached (Click file name to download & check)
1	AoA	<input type="button" value="Attach"/>	
2	PoA	<input type="button" value="Attach"/>	
3	Others (Optional)	<input type="button" value="Attach"/>	

NOMINATED AUTHORITY
AUCTION OF COAL MINES FOR SALE OF COAL

[Home](#) | [About Us](#) | [www.mstcindia.co.in](#) | [Help](#) | [Contact Us](#) | [Logout](#)

cbuser3 You last logged in at :: 2020-06-17 14:48:45.172669 | Login IP :10.1.3.221

Attach Documents

Event to attach file: MSTC/HO/Nominated Authority/71/New Delhi/20-21/311

[Go to Bid Floor](#)

Attach files for the following documents:

Sl.No.	Documents to be attached	Action	File attached (Click file name to download & check)
1	AoA	<input type="button" value="Detach"/>	demodoc1.pdf
2	PoA	<input type="button" value="Detach"/>	demodoc7.pdf
3	Others (Optional)	<input type="button" value="Detach"/>	demodoc3.pdf



GOVERNMENT OF INDIA
MINISTRY OF COAL
 (An ISO 9001:2008 Certified Ministry)



NOMINATED AUTHORITY

AUCTION OF COAL MINES FOR SALE OF COAL

[Home](#) | [About Us](#) | [www.mstcindia.co.in](#) | [Help](#) | [Contact Us](#) | [Logout](#)

cbuser3 You last logged in at :: 2020-06-17 14:48:45.172669 | Login IP :10.1.3.221



HI MSTCDS3

EVENT INFO

[Back](#)

Events Details

Current Server Time:

IST

Event No	Event Type	Event Start Time	Event Close Time	Currency
MSTC/HO/Nominated Authority/71/New Delhi/20-21/311	Stage I Bid Submission	18.06.2020 13:15:00	27.06.2020 14:30:00	%

No	Name	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Bid Status
1	Utkal B 1	Technical Bid	Initial Offer	Initial Offer Saved

[Final Submission](#)

[Attach Document](#)